

EXHIBIT A



10100 SANTA MONICA BLVD
SUITE 2200
LOS ANGELES, CA 90067
(310) 282-2000 IRS #95-1780806

THOMAS SEAMAN
THOMAS SEAMAN COMPANY
3 PARK PLAZA, SUITE 550
IRVINE, CA 92614

MARCH 19, 2018
INVOICE NO. 1763016

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

RE: DIGITAL ALTITUDE
OUR FILE NO: 211605-10008

FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS PER ATTACHED DETAIL	36,880.00
DISBURSEMENTS MADE FOR YOUR ACCOUNT AS PER ATTACHED DETAIL	726.84
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE	<hr/> 37,606.84

PAYMENT OPTIONS

Payment by wire or ACH, please use the following :

City National Bank ABA: 122016066
2029 Century Park East Account no: 210-034722
Los Angeles, CA, 90067 Beneficiary: Loeb & Loeb LLP - General Account
SWIFT Code: CINAUS6L

Payment by check, please remit to:

Loeb & Loeb LLP
10100 Santa Monica Blvd
Suite 2200
Los Angeles, CA 90067

** Please include as a reference client no: 211605 or invoice number 1763016.
To aid in application of the payment, details should be sent to epayment@loeb.com.



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
PAGE 2

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
1/29/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM THOMAS SEAMAN, AND CONFERENCE WITH LANCE JURICH, RE [REDACTED]	0.2
1/30/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM LANCE JURICH AND THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]; ENGAGED AS TO ARRANGEMENTS FOR SAME	0.4
2/1/18	LNJ	CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN; MEETING WITH B. KING; REVIEWED DOCS; ENGAGED AS TO TAKEOVER ISSUES AND BANK FREEZING; REVIEWED NOTES	1.2
2/1/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] ID [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.2
2/1/18	BRK	REVIEWED COMPLAINT AND TRO RE NATURE OF ALLEGATIONS AND ANALYSIS OF [REDACTED]	1.4
2/1/18	BRK	REVIEWED FTC NOTES TO RECEIVER RE LOCATIONS OF ASSETS AND INFORMATION HELPFUL FOR UPCOMING TAKEOVER	0.2
2/1/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO LANCE JURICH RE [REDACTED]	0.1
2/1/18	BRK	REVIEWED DIGITAL ALTITUDE WEBSITE AND RELATED ONLINE MATERIALS RE [REDACTED]	0.8
2/2/18	LNJ	CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN; PREPARED FOR TAKEOVER; ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES AND REVIEW OF ORDER	0.4
2/3/18	BRK	REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN FTC AND RECEIVER RE [REDACTED]	0.3
2/4/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO TAKEOVER ISSUES; E-MAIL TO T. SEAMAN; E-MAIL TO B. KING; E-MAIL FROM B. KING RE [REDACTED]	0.3
2/4/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.2
2/5/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO TAKEOVER ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN; CONFERENCE WITH B. KING; ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RE TAKEOVER.	0.8
2/5/18	BRK	TRAVEL TO OREM UTAH TO ASSIST RECEIVER WITH TAKEOVER AT DEFENDANT OFFICES	5.2



MATTER # 211605-10008
 INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
 DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
 PAGE 3

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/5/18	BRK	ATTENDED RECEIVER TAKEOVER OF OFFICES OF DEFENDANT DIGITAL ALTITUDE AND ASSISTED RECEIVER AND RECEIVER STAFF RE SAME (INCLUDING INTERVIEWS OF ONSITE PERSONS)	9.4
2/6/18	LNJ	CONFERENCE WITH B. KING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN; ENGAGED AS TO RECORDING OF ORDER TO PROVIDE NOTICE; ANALYZED [REDACTED]; ENGAGED AS TO PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS.	0.7
2/6/18	BRK	RETURN TRAVEL FROM OREM, UTAH TO LOS ANGELES FOLLOWING RECEIVER TAKEOVER OPERATION	4.7
2/6/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN AND ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (SEVERAL CALLS)	1.2
2/6/18	BRK	RESEARCHED ONLINE MATERIALS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.8
2/6/18	BRK	REVIEWED EMAILS FROM MARY DEE RE UPCOMING APEX EVENT IN WHISTLER CANADA AND OTHER BUSINESS OPERATIONAL ISSUES	0.2
2/6/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN COMPANY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
2/7/18	BRK	REVIEWED AND ANALYZED INFORMATION PROVIDED BY ATTY ANDREW GORDON, MARY DEE, AND JASMINE HOWELL RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.2
2/7/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM JODY GOODMAN AT FTC RE CONTACT INFORMATION FOR RECEIVER SERVICE LIST	0.1
2/7/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
2/7/18	BRK	REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN THOMAS SEAMAN, ANDREW GORDON AND MARY DEE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.2
2/8/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.5



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
PAGE 4

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/8/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ANDREW GORDON RE DEFENDANT INQUIRIES ON BUSINESS OPERATIONS AND CALL TO DISCUSS SAME	0.2
2/8/18	BRK	REVIEWED EMAILS AND ATTACHMENTS FROM ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.3
2/8/18	BRK	REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN THE RECEIVER AND THE FTC RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.1
2/9/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN; ENGAGED AS TO TAKEOVER ISSUES; ENGAGED AS TO MOTION FOR INSTRUCTIONS; E-MAIL TO B. KING RE [REDACTED]; ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RE [REDACTED]; LETTER TO T. SEAMAN; ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RE RECEIVER.	1.2
2/9/18	BRK	REVIEWED EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN RECEIVER AND FTC RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.2
2/9/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ANDREW GORDON RE CALL TO DISCUSS UPCOMING APEX CONFERENCE AND RELATED ISSUES (SEVERAL)	0.1
2/9/18	BRK	PREPARED FOR, AND PARTICIPATED IN, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ANDREW GORDON, MARY DEE, MICHAEL FORCE, AND THOMAS SEAMAN RE BUSINESS CONTINUATION ISSUES AND UPCOMING APEX CONFERENCE	1.4
2/9/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.5
2/9/18	BRK	REVIEWED AND REVISED DRAFT NOTIFICATION TO INTERESTED PARTIES RE SUSPENSION OF DEFENDANT BUSINESS OPERATIONS	1.6
2/12/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES; E-MAIL TO T. SEAMAN; REVIEWED CREDIT CARD ISSUES RE REFUNDS; ANALYZED [REDACTED]	0.8
2/12/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ATTY LANCE JURICH RE [REDACTED]	0.2



MATTER # 211605-10008
 INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
 DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
 PAGE 5

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/12/18	BRK	REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN RECEIVER AND DEFENDANTS RE BUSINESS CONTINUATION, FUNDS PROCESSING ISSUES, AND DEFENDANT REQUESTS FOR RELEASE OF FUNDS FOR LIVING EXPENSES (SEVERAL)	0.2
2/12/18	BRK	REVIEWED AND ANALYZED [REDACTED] AND RE NOTICE AND BUSINESS CONTINUATION ISSUES	0.3
2/12/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.3
2/13/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]; ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RE INITIAL RECEIVER REPORT; ANALYZED [REDACTED]	0.7
2/13/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.3
2/13/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.9
2/15/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN AND ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.2
2/15/18	BRK	RESEARCHED [REDACTED]	1.7
2/16/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES; REVIEWED RECORDING ISSUES; ENGAGED AS TO FREEZE ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN.	0.4
2/16/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.2
2/16/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
2/17/18	LNJ	E-MAIL FROM T. SEAMAN; REVIEWED AND REVISED OUTLINE FOR INITIAL REPORT; ENGAGED AS TO [REDACTED].	0.8
2/18/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER REPORT ISSUES AND DRAFTING.	0.3



MATTER # 211605-10008
 INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
 DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
 PAGE 6

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/19/18	BRK	EMAIL FROM, AND TELEPHONE TO, THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.3
2/20/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE FROM T. SEAMAN (.1); TELEPHONE TO T. SEAMAN AND CONFERENCE RE [REDACTED] (.5); ENGAGED AS TO REVISIONS AND DRAFTING OF REPORT [REDACTED] (.8).	1.4
2/20/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (2 CALLS)	0.4
2/20/18	BRK	REVIEWED AND ANALYZED CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN [REDACTED] (SEVERAL EMAILS) AND ENGAGED AS TO OPEN ISSUES RE SAME	0.3
2/20/18	BRK	REVIEWED RECEIVER NOTES RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.3
2/21/18	BRK	TELEPHONE AND EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.6
2/21/18	BRK	PREPARED FORM OF RECEIVER'S FIRST REPORT AND BEGAN DRAFTING ATTORNEY PORTIONS RE SAME	1.5
2/21/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM JODY GOODMAN AT FTC RE SCHEDULE FOR DEPOSITIONS AND RECEIVER ATTENDANCE AT SAME	0.1
2/22/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES (.2); ANALYZED AND REVISED REPORT (.3); REVISED REPORT (.2); REVIEWED NOTICE ISSUES (.1).	0.8
2/22/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM, AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH, ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.4
2/22/18	BRK	REVIEWED AND ANALYZED [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.2
2/23/18	BRK	BEGAN DRAFTING NOTICE OF DESIGNATION OF AFFILIATE ENTITIES AS RECEIVERSHIP ENTITIES	0.4



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
PAGE 7

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/23/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.2
2/26/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.2
2/26/18	BRK	REVIEWED EMAILS AND COURT ORDER TRANSMITTED BY ANDREW HUDSON RE BRIEFING DEADLINE FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING (SEVERAL)	0.2
2/26/18	BRK	TELEPHONE TO, AND EMAIL FROM, ALISON JUROE AT THOMAS SEAMAN COMPANY RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.2
2/26/18	BRK	FURTHER DRAFTED AND REVISED RECEIVER'S NOTICE OF IDENTIFICATION OF ADDITIONAL RECEIVERSHIP ENTITIES	1.4
2/26/18	BRK	EMAIL TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.1
2/27/18	LNJ	REVIEWED AND REVISED REPORT (.6); ENGAGED AS TO CHANGES AND RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] (.3).	0.9
2/27/18	BRK	EMAIL TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.1
2/27/18	BRK	REVISED AND FINALIZED RECEIVER'S NOTICE OF IDENTIFICATION OF ADDITIONAL RECEIVERSHIP ENTITIES AND ENGAGED AS TO FILING AND SERVICE ISSUES FOR SAME	1.1
2/27/18	BRK	REVIEWED OPPOSITION OF MARY DEE TO MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION	0.4
2/27/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM JODY GOODMAN AT FTC RE SERVICE LIST ISSUES (FOR RECEIVER'S NOTICE TO BE FILED)	0.1
2/27/18	BRK	REVIEWED DOCKET ENTRY AND EMAILS FROM ANDREW GORDON RE CHANGES IN SCHEDULE FOR BRIEFING ON PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION ISSUES	0.1
2/28/18	LNJ	REVIEWED AND REVISED REPORT.	0.6
2/28/18	BRK	REVIEWED, DRAFTED, AND REVISED RECEIVER'S FIRST REPORT	2.4
2/28/18	BRK	EMAILS AND TELEPHONE TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.4



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1763016

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

3/19/2018
PAGE 8

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
2/28/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN AND ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.1

Time & Fee Summary

Timekeeper	Init	Hours	Rate	Fee Value
B R KING	BRK	48.2	595.00	28,679.00
L N JURICH	LNJ	11.8	695.00	8,201.00
TOTAL		60.0		36,880.00

Disbursement Detail

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
2/27/18	AIRFARE PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - COACH/ECONOMY ROUTE: SALT LAKE CITY, UT TKT#0062311939060; TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	379.60
2/27/18	OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL INTERNET; 02/01/18 PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER. 02/05/2018 TO 02/06/2018	32.00
2/27/18	OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL TAXI/CAR SERVICE; 02/05/18 PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	31.00
2/27/18	OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL TAXI/CAR SERVICE; 02/06/18 PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	34.00
2/27/18	OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL CAR RENTAL/FUEL; 02/05/18 PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	76.87
2/27/18	LODGING 02/05/18 PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	154.94
2/27/18	OUT OF TOWN MEALS PAYEE: BENJAMIN KING - TRAVEL TO UTAH FOR BUSINESS TAKEOVER.	18.43
TOTAL		726.84



10100 SANTA MONICA BLVD
SUITE 2200
LOS ANGELES, CA 90067
(310) 282-2000 IRS #95-1780806

APRIL 5, 2018
INVOICE NO. 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
THOMAS SEAMAN COMPANY
3 PARK PLAZA, SUITE 550
IRVINE, CA 92614

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

RE: DIGITAL ALTITUDE
OUR FILE NO: 211605-10008

FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS PER ATTACHED DETAIL	25,320.00
DISBURSEMENTS MADE FOR YOUR ACCOUNT AS PER ATTACHED DETAIL	47.67
TOTAL CURRENT AMOUNT DUE	25,367.67

PAYMENT OPTIONS

<p>Payment by wire or ACH, please use the following :</p> <p>City National Bank ABA: 122016066 2029 Century Park East Account no: 210-034722 Los Angeles, CA, 90067 Beneficiary: Loeb & Loeb LLP - General Account SWIFT Code: CINAUS6L</p>	<p>Payment by check, please remit to:</p> <p>Loeb & Loeb LLP 10100 Santa Monica Blvd Suite 2200 Los Angeles, CA 90067</p>
--	---

** Please include as a reference client no: 211605 or invoice number 1764920.
To aid in application of the payment, details should be sent to epayment@loeb.com.



MATTER # 211605-10008
 INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
 DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
 PAGE 2

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
3/1/18	LNJ	REVIEWED AND REVISED REPORT (.7); ENGAGED AS TO FURTHER REVISIONS TO REPORT (.4).	1.1
3/1/18	BRK	CONTINUED REVISIONS TO DRAFT RECEIVER'S FIRST REPORT	0.7
3/1/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.3
3/1/18	BRK	ENGAGED AS TO FILING AND SERVICE OF RECEIVER'S FIRST REPORT (INCLUDING PREPARATION OF EXHIBITS FOR SAME)	0.4
3/1/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
3/2/18	LNJ	REVIEWED MOTION FOR LIVE TESTIMONY; E-MAIL FROM B. KING; ENGAGED AS TO HEARING ISSUES; REVIEWED DECLARATIONS RE FTC ACTION; ENGAGED AS TO HEARING PREP.	1.8
3/2/18	BRK	REVIEWED SEVERAL DECLARATIONS AND FILINGS SUBMITTED BY FTC AND DEFENDANTS RE UPCOMING PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING	0.7
3/2/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
3/2/18	BRK	REVIEWED SUPPLEMENTAL EMERGENCY MOTION FOR LIVE TESTIMONY AND ANALYSIS RE [REDACTED]	0.3
3/2/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL CALLS)	0.7
3/3/18	LNJ	REVIEWED BRIEFING RE HEARING (.3); REVIEWED RECENT FILINGS BY FTC (.2); ENGAGED AS TO HEARING PREPARATION (.3); E-MAIL FROM B. KING (.1); REVIEWED FILINGS FROM B. KING (.5).	1.4
3/3/18	BRK	REVIEWED COURT WEBSITE RE TENTATIVE RULING PROCEDURES AND POSSIBLE TENTATIVE RULING ON PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION MOTION	0.2
3/3/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO DARREN CLEVINGER RE [REDACTED]	0.2



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
PAGE 3

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
3/3/18	BRK	EMAILS TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.3
3/3/18	BRK	REVIEWED FTC REPLY PAPERS AND EXHIBITS RE PREPARATION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING	0.7
3/3/18	BRK	REVIEWED COURT DOCKET RE STATUS OF ORDER ON MOTIONS FOR LIVE TESTIMONY AT PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING	0.2
3/4/18	BRK	REVIEWED COURT WEBSITE RE POTENTIAL RULING ON LIVE TESTIMONY MOTION AND TENTATIVE RULING ON PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION	0.1
3/5/18	LNJ	CONFERENCE WITH B. KING (FROM COURT) (.1); ENGAGED AS TO ASSISTANCE TO B. KING RE TRIAL TESTIMONY (.6); ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES (.2); REVIEWED AND REVISED SEAMAN DECLARATION AND EMAIL FROM B. KING (.2).	1.1
3/5/18	BRK	ATTENDED EVIDENTIARY HEARING PROCEEDING RE MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION (INCLUDING CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE TESTIMONY AT SAME)	4.2
3/5/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO, AND TELEPHONE TO, LANCE JURICH RE [REDACTED]	0.2
3/5/18	BRK	DRAFTED AND REVISED DECLARATION OF THOMAS SEAMAN ATTACHING NOTES OF DIGITAL ALTITUDE SALES TRAINING CONFERENCE	0.5
3/5/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.3
3/6/18	LNJ	MEETING WITH B. KING RE HEARING (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (.3); RESEARCHED ISSUES RE [REDACTED] (.5).	1.0
3/6/18	BRK	FURTHER PREPARED FOR, AND ATTENDED, CONTINUED EVIDENTIARY HEARING PROCEEDING RE MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION (INCLUDING CONFERENCES WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE TESTIMONY AT SAME)	5.3
3/7/18	LNJ	E-MAIL FROM POTENTIAL VICTIM (.1); ;ENGAGED AS TO RESPONSE (.2); ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RE RECEIVER AND CLAIMS (.5).	0.8



MATTER # 211605-10008
 INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
 DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
 PAGE 4

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
3/8/18	LNJ	E-MAIL TO B. KING (.1); E-MAIL FROM B. KING (.1); ENGAGED AS TO ENFORCEMENT AND ASSET RECOVERY ISSUES (.4).	0.6
3/9/18	LNJ	REVIEWED JUDGE'S ORDER (.2); E-MAIL FROM T. SEAMAN (.1); ENGAGED AS TO PROPOSED ACTIONS RE RECOVERIES (.4).	0.7
3/10/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RECEIVER RE [REDACTED]	0.3
3/11/18	BRK	REVIEWED COURT'S ORDER ON PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION	0.4
3/11/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.3
3/12/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE FROM L. NICHOLAS AND E-MAIL TO B. KING (.1); ENGAGED AS TO RECOVERY AND TOLLING ISSUES WITH RECEIVER (.5).	0.6
3/12/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.8
3/12/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO DARREN CLEVINGER RE [REDACTED] (SEVERAL)	0.4
3/12/18	BRK	REVIEWED SOUZA SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND ANALYZED [REDACTED]	0.8
3/13/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO FORMER DIGITAL ALTITUDE AGENT LYNN NICHOLS RE INQUIRY INTO RECEIVERSHIP	0.3
3/15/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM, AND TELEPHONE AND EMAIL TO, THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.2
3/16/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (.2); TELEPHONE FROM QUINN (ATTORNEY FOR PARTY WHO RECEIVED PAYMENT) (.1); E-MAIL TO B. KING RE [REDACTED] (.1).	0.4
3/16/18	BRK	EMAILS TO AND FROM DARREN CLEVINGER AND ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.2
3/16/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.1



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
PAGE 5

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
3/16/18	BRK	REVIEWED BANK RECORDS AND SUMMARY RE CONFIRMATION OF WIRES SENT TO JOHN SOUZA AND EMAIL FROM ALISON JUROE RE [REDACTED]	0.2
3/16/18	BRK	TELEPHONE FROM AND TO MICHAEL QUINN (COUNSEL FOR JOHN SOUZA) RE RECOVERY OF SETTLEMENT OVERPAYMENT TO JOHN SOUZA	0.1
3/19/18	LNJ	E-MAIL TO T. SEAMAN (.1); ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER RECOVERY ITEMS (.3).	0.4
3/19/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN AND DAVID BARTONE RE [REDACTED]	0.1
3/20/18	LNJ	E-MAIL FROM P. NOLAN (.1); REVIEWED P. NOLAN BLOG POSTING WITH ACCUSATIONS OF LYING (AND ANALYZED AND PREPARED RECEIVER RESPONSE) (.6).	0.7
3/21/18	LNJ	REVIEWED LETTER FROM PARTY AND PREPARED RESPONSE (.5); E-MAIL TO T. SEAMAN AND B. KING RE [REDACTED] (.1).	0.6
3/22/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES (.5); REVIEWED AND REVISED RESPONSE LETTER (.2); CONFERENCE WITH B. KING RE RECEIVER ISSUES (.1).	0.8
3/22/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.8
3/22/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.3
3/22/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO ATTORNEY DAVID BARTONE RE DISCUSSION WITH THIRD-PARTY JOINT VENTURERS	0.1
3/22/18	BRK	PREPARED EMAIL RESPONSE TO THIRD-PARTY PETER NOLAN RE DISPUTES OF FTC POSITION IN BLOG POSTING	0.3
3/23/18	LNJ	E-MAIL FROM B. KING RE [REDACTED] (.1); CONFERENCE WITH B. KING RE [REDACTED] (.1); ENGAGED AS TO RECOVERY ISSUES RE BRINGING ASSETS BACK TO THE ESTATE (.5).	0.7
3/23/18	BRK	EMAILS FROM AND TO THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.2
3/24/18	LNJ	E-MAIL TO RECEIVER RE [REDACTED].	0.1
3/26/18	LNJ	ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES AND RESPONSES WITH B. KING.	0.3



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
PAGE 6

Date	TK	Description of Services Rendered	Hours
3/26/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THOMAS SEAMAN AND DAVID BARTONE RE MERCHANT ACCOUNTS MAINTAINED BY RYAN JATEN AND BEAU REED	0.6
3/26/18	BRK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THOMAS SEAMAN RE [REDACTED]	0.4
3/26/18	BRK	DRAFTED AND REVISED EMAIL TO DAVID BARTONE RE DEMAND FOR TURNOVER OF RETAINER FUNDS TRANSFERRED TO HIM AFTER ASSET FREEZE	0.7
3/27/18	LNJ	E-MAIL FROM T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (.2); ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVER ISSUES AND STRATEGY (.3); ANALYZED [REDACTED] (.2).	0.7
3/28/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE FROM T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (.1); ENGAGED AS TO RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES (.3).	0.4
3/30/18	LNJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SEAMAN RE [REDACTED] (.2); ENGAGED AS TO ISSUES RAISED BY RECEIVER (.5).	0.7
3/30/18	BRK	TELEPHONE TO AND FROM MICHAEL QUINN RE DISPUTE OVER SOUZA SETTLEMENT FUNDS	0.6
3/30/18	BRK	FURTHER DRAFTED RESPONSE TO SOUZA RE REFUSAL TO TURN OVER OVERPAID FUNDS AND REVIEWED BANK RECORDS RELATING TO SAME	0.8

Time & Fee Summary

Timekeeper	Init	Hours	Rate	Fee Value
B R KING	BRK	24.8	595.00	14,756.00
L N JURICH	LNJ	15.2	695.00	10,564.00
TOTAL		40.0		25,320.00



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
PAGE 7

Disbursement Detail

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
3/22/18	ONLINE RESEARCH PACER COURT RESEARCH - FEBRUARY 2018	10.40
3/31/18	PHOTOCOPY	31.20
3/31/18	POSTAGE	6.07
	TOTAL	47.67



MATTER # 211605-10008
INVOICE # 1764920

THOMAS SEAMAN
DIGITAL ALTITUDE

4/5/2018
PAGE 8

STATEMENT OF PRIOR OUTSTANDING INVOICES

INVOICE NUMBER	INVOICE DATE	INVOICE AMOUNT	PAYMENTS TO DATE	INVOICE BALANCE
1763016	03/19/18	37,606.84	0.00	37,606.84
	TOTALS	37,606.84	0.00	37,606.84